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Endangered Hawaiian Monk Seal RH38 Receiving Life-Saving Care at The Marine Mammal 

Center  

The well-known seal has previously received care at the Center’s Hawai‘i Island based hospital in 2017 
and 2019 

(Kailua-Kona, Hawai‘i – July 13, 2023) – The Marine Mammal Center, the world’s largest marine 
mammal hospital, has admitted an endangered Hawaiian monk seal at the Center’s hospital in Kailua-

Kona, Ke Kai Ola. The adult female monk seal, RH38, is currently in stable condition. The successful 
rescue of RH38 from Kaua'i was made possible thanks to support from the community and the Center’s 

partnership with the National Oceanic and Atmospheric Administration (NOAA) and the U.S. Coast 
Guard (USCG).  

“Before the rescue, RH38 was monitored for over a week. She displayed intermittent logging behavior in 
shallow water, meaning she was floating instead of actively swimming, and appeared weak, raising 

questions about her overall energy levels and strength,” says Dr. Sophie Whoriskey, Hawaiian Monk Seal 
Conservation Veterinarian at The Marine Mammal Center. “Given this seal’s prior history, including 

being treated for kidney stones, the decision was made to rescue RH38 for further evaluation.”  
 
During the seal’s initial critical care period which included an admission exam, the Center’s veterinary 

team noted that RH38 was alert, reactive, and in good body condition. Experts collected blood, urine, and 
did a brief ultrasound of the kidneys and bladder during the initial exam that revealed abnormalities in the 
kidneys and uterus. The ultrasound also revealed RH38 is suffering from kidney stones and has a fracture 

of her left upper canine tooth.  
 

The Center’s veterinary team performed additional diagnostics for RH38 including full body radiographs 
(X-rays) and a more extensive abdominal ultrasound exam. Experts also submitted a series of blood 
samples for diagnostic testing to check for signs of disease, some of which will take several weeks to 
process. The team can confirm that the animal’s antibody test for toxoplasmosis was negative.  

Animal care experts are offering her a hearty and calorie-rich diet of sustainably caught herring and she 
has shown a great appetite. RH38 is also receiving antibiotics for suspected pneumonia.  

A TIMELY RESPONSE TO A SEAL IN NEED 

Thanks to members of the public calling NOAA’s statewide marine wildlife hotline (888-256-9840), 
NOAA was alerted to RH38’s abnormal logging behavior. After monitoring RH38’s behavior over about 
a week, and carefully weighing the benefits and risks of intervention, NOAA, with input from the Hawaiʻi 
Department of Land and Natural Resources (DLNR) and the Center, decided that given RH38’s notable 
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behavior change and prior history, medical assessment, and treatment were in her best interest. A 

successful response was conducted on June 24, and the USCG transported her to the Center the next day.  
 
“Sometimes seals don’t clearly show signs that they’re sick or healthy. It’s our job to carefully assess 

each individual seal, consider what’s normal behavior and body condition for that seal, compare that to 
their past medical history, and what care we might be able to provide them, to make the best decision 

possible for each seal,” said Diana Kramer, Regional Stranding Coordinator for NOAA’s Pacific Islands 
Regional Office. “We are grateful to those who called our hotline to report RH38’s abnormal behavior, 
and our partners at DLNR and the Center for a collaborative effort to help assess, rescue, and provide care 
for RH38.”  

 

RH38 was born in 2016 and was first admitted to Ke Kai Ola in 2017 for malnutrition and gastrointestinal 
parasites. She was released in good health and came back in 2019 with a several health concerns 
including severe traumatic myositis (muscle inflammation) that was diagnosed on CT scan, septicemic 
infection, kidney stones in both kidneys, urinary tract infection, and presumed pneumonia.   
 

Since 2014, the Center has rehabilitated and released 42 monk seals, most of which have been rescued 
from and returned to the Papahānaumokuākea Marine National Monument as part of the Center’s 
partnership with NOAA Fisheries. Together, the Center works with NOAA to identify seals in need, 
rescue and rehabilitate them, and give them a second chance at life.  
 

The Center’s partnership with NOAA Fisheries and other cooperating agencies is more important than 

ever to prevent this endangered species from becoming extinct.   

HOW THE PUBLIC CAN HELP  

The public should keep a safe distance of at least 50 feet from monk seals and at least 150 feet from monk 
seal mothers with pups. On Hawaiʻi Island and Maui, sightings can also be reported to the Center’s 

response team via 24-hour hotline: 808-987-0765 (Hawai‘i Island) and 808-292-2372 (Maui).  

Report hooked, stranded or entangled monk seals to the statewide NOAA Fisheries Marine Wildlife 

Hotline at 1-888-256-9840.  

VOLUNTEER OPPORTUNITIES ON HAWAIʻI AND MAUI 

The Marine Mammal Center is recruiting new volunteers for operations on Maui. Learn more about 

volunteering and sign up to attend upcoming virtual trainings on The Marine Mammal Center’s website.  

Hawaiian monk seal conservation volunteers play an integral role in helping save this endangered species 
by monitoring and identifying seals that may require rescue and rehabilitation. Volunteers also provide 

valuable public outreach to help raise awareness about the risks of human and pet interactions, and why 
this native animal is critical to the health of our shared ocean home. 

The Center values volunteer engagement and inclusivity, and is proud to welcome existing and new 
volunteers into its ‘ohana, or family, to create an even more robust and diverse community of volunteers. 

INTERVIEWS 

Please contact Media@tmmc.org to arrange interviews. 

 

https://www.fisheries.noaa.gov/pacific-islands/marine-life-viewing-guidelines/viewing-marine-wildlife-hawaii
https://www.marinemammalcenter.org/get-involved/volunteer/hawaii/hawaii-island?utm_source=media&utm_medium=digital&utm_campaign=hawaii&ms=media
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ABOUT THE MARINE MAMMAL CENTER 

The Marine Mammal Center is a global leader in marine mammal health, science and conservation, and is 
the largest marine mammal hospital in the world. As a leading contributor to the global body of research 
and knowledge about marine mammal medicine and ocean health, the Center generates research findings 

and scientific outputs at volumes comparable to top academic institutions and prides itself on gathering 
and providing open research data that is free to access, reuse, repurpose and redistribute. The Center’s 

teaching hospital and training programs operate globally with headquarters in Sausalito, CA. The Center 
has rescued more than 24,000 marine mammals from 600 miles of authorized rescue area along the 
California coastline and Hawai‘i. The Center’s mission is to advance global ocean conservation through 
marine mammal rescue and rehabilitation, scientific research, and education. 

For more information, please visit MarineMammalCenter.org. Follow us on Facebook, Instagram and 
Twitter.  

 

https://www.marinemammalcenter.org/?utm_source=media&utm_medium=digital&ms=media
https://www.facebook.com/themarinemammalcenter
https://www.instagram.com/themarinemammalcenter
https://www.twitter.com/TMMC

